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The Mexican Revolution was a defining moment in the history of race relations, impacting both Mexican and
African Americans. For black Westerners, 1910–1920 did not represent the clear-cut promise of populist
power, but a reordering of the complex social hierarchy which had, since the nineteenth century, granted
them greater freedom in the borderlands than in the rest of the United States.

Despite its lasting significance, the story of black Americans along the Mexican border has been sorely
underreported in the annals of U.S. history. Gerald Horne brings the tale to life in Black and Brown.
Drawing on archives on both sides of the border, a host of cutting-edge studies and oral histories, Horne
chronicles the political currents which created and then undermined the Mexican border as a relative safe
haven for African Americans. His account addresses blacks' role as “Indian fighters,” the relationship
between African Americans and immigrants, and the U.S. government's growing fear of black disloyalty,
among other essential concerns of the period: the heavy reliance of the U.S. on black soldiers along the
border placed white supremacy and national security on a collision course that was ultimately resolved in
favor of the latter.

Mining a forgotten chapter in American history, Black and Brown offers tremendous insight into the past
and future of race relations along the Mexican border.
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From reader reviews:

Micheal Summers:

Exactly why? Because this Black and Brown: African Americans and the Mexican Revolution, 1910-1920
(American History and Culture) is an unordinary book that the inside of the book waiting for you to snap the
item but latter it will shock you with the secret the idea inside. Reading this book alongside it was fantastic
author who all write the book in such incredible way makes the content inside easier to understand,
entertaining technique but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having
this ever again or you going to regret it. This phenomenal book will give you a lot of benefits than the other
book have such as help improving your expertise and your critical thinking technique. So , still want to
hesitate having that book? If I had been you I will go to the guide store hurriedly.

Daniel Ellis:

The book untitled Black and Brown: African Americans and the Mexican Revolution, 1910-1920 (American
History and Culture) contain a lot of information on this. The writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy
technique. The language is very simple to implement all the people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy
to read the item. The book was published by famous author. The author gives you in the new time of literary
works. It is easy to read this book because you can read on your smart phone, or product, so you can read the
book within anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can start their
official web-site and also order it. Have a nice learn.

Willis Newby:

Beside this particular Black and Brown: African Americans and the Mexican Revolution, 1910-1920
(American History and Culture) in your phone, it could possibly give you a way to get closer to the new
knowledge or facts. The information and the knowledge you can got here is fresh from oven so don't be
worry if you feel like an old people live in narrow commune. It is good thing to have Black and Brown:
African Americans and the Mexican Revolution, 1910-1920 (American History and Culture) because this
book offers for you readable information. Do you sometimes have book but you would not get what it's
interesting features of. Oh come on, that won't happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable option
here cannot be questionable, just like treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss it? Find this book
as well as read it from at this point!

Ana May:

Guide is one of source of knowledge. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students but native or
citizen need book to know the change information of year to help year. As we know those guides have many
advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the world. From the book Black
and Brown: African Americans and the Mexican Revolution, 1910-1920 (American History and Culture) we
can acquire more advantage. Don't you to be creative people? To become creative person must choose to



read a book. Merely choose the best book that acceptable with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change
your life by this book Black and Brown: African Americans and the Mexican Revolution, 1910-1920
(American History and Culture). You can more attractive than now.
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