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The Wind Is Not a River is Brian Payton's gripping tale of survival and an epic love story in which a husband
and wife—separated by the only battle of World War II to take place on American soil—fight to reunite
in Alaska's starkly beautiful Aleutian Islands.

Following the death of his younger brother in Europe, journalist John Easley is determined to find meaning
in his loss. Leaving behind his beloved wife, Helen, he heads north to investigate the Japanese invasion of
Alaska's Aleutian Islands, a story censored by the U.S. government. 

While John is accompanying a crew on a bombing run, his plane is shot down over the island of Attu. He
survives only to find himself exposed to a harsh and unforgiving wilderness, known as “the birthplace of
winds.” There, John must battle the elements, starvation, and his own remorse while evading discovery by
the Japanese. 

Alone at home, Helen struggles with the burden of her husband's disappearance. Caught in extraordinary
circumstances, in this new world of the missing, she is forced to reimagine who she is—and what she is
capable of doing. Somehow, she must find John and bring him home, a quest that takes her into the farthest
reaches of the war, beyond the safety of everything she knows. 
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From reader reviews:

Catherine Scott:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information that will give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world can easily
share their idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire their reader with
their story or maybe their experience. Not only situation that share in the publications. But also they write
about the data about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
kids, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors nowadays always try to improve their
talent in writing, they also doing some study before they write with their book. One of them is this The Wind
Is Not a River.

Bella Singer:

The Wind Is Not a River can be one of your beginner books that are good idea. Many of us recommend that
straight away because this guide has good vocabulary that could increase your knowledge in language, easy
to understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information. The copy writer giving his/her effort to set
every word into pleasure arrangement in writing The Wind Is Not a River yet doesn't forget the main stage,
giving the reader the hottest and based confirm resource information that maybe you can be among it. This
great information may drawn you into new stage of crucial contemplating.

Wendy Lambert:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book as
compared to can satisfy your limited time to read it because this time you only find e-book that need more
time to be study. The Wind Is Not a River can be your answer since it can be read by a person who have
those short free time problems.

Lionel Huggins:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from a book. Book is prepared or printed or descriptive from each source that will filled update
of news. In this modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media
social like newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You can
add your knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
looking for the The Wind Is Not a River when you necessary it?
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