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With this unique resource, you'll discover how to unlock the power behind Excel Services in order to
effectively utilize server-side spreadsheet calculation and rendering. It walks you through all programming
aspects of Excel Services, covering everything from APIs to UDFs (User Defined Functions). You'll quickly
gain a strong understanding of what Excel Services is, how to work with it, and how to develop applications
using its robust features.

Written by the senior software development engineer for Excel Services, this book first provides you with
detailed explanations about the various programmability options Excel Services offers. You'll then gain an
inside look into the problematic areas that you must avoid. And you'll find ideas for solutions that you can
create using this server technology. This information will help you extend and work against Excel Services
as you develop business-critical applications.

What you will learn from this book

Steps for streamlining work with the Excel Web Services API●

In-depth explanations about Excel Services UDFs, including various ways to make them work in Excel●

2007
How to use Excel Models to extend your applications●

Various techniques used to employ both Excel and Excel Services in end-to-end solutions.●

How to streamline processes that rely on Excel spreadsheets, such as modeling, handling, and storing data●

Tools used for generating Excel Workbook-based custom Web services, RSS feeds, and more●

Hints for building your own mashups using Excel Services●

Who this book is for

This book is for developers who have built applications on Excel or have used a spreadsheet as a starting
point for code. You should be comfortable working in the .NET environment.

"More solutions are built on Microsoft Excel than any other Office tool. Excel Services extends Excel to the
server and opens up a whole new world of applications. This book is a must read for developers looking to
take advantage of this new server functionality."
—PJ Hough, Director of Program Managment, Microsoft Office, Microsoft Corporation

"Excel is probably the most used end-user tool among our Microsoft customers, and Excel 2007 is
emphasizing this trend even more. By adding Excel Services to the Microsoft Business Intelligence stack,
our customers have the ground to create better and more manageable enterprise-oriented solutions while
using Excel! This book helps you understand what Excel Services is, how it works, and how to develop
solutions using the web services API it provides. It is a great resource for any serious developer looking to
leverage the power of Excel in enterprise applications."
—Stig Torngaard Hammeken, VP of Consulting, Platon A/S

Wrox Professional guides are planned and written by working programmers to meet the real-world needs of



programmers, developers, and IT professionals. Focused and relevant, they address the issues technology
professionals face every day. They provide examples, practical solutions, and expert education in new
technologies, all designed to help programmers do a better job.
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From reader reviews:

Cora Morrell:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a book. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add
your knowledge by the book entitled Professional Excel Services (Programmer to Programmer). Try to make
book Professional Excel Services (Programmer to Programmer) as your good friend. It means that it can to
get your friend when you sense alone and beside that course make you smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is
very fortuned in your case. The book makes you a lot more confidence because you can know anything by
the book. So , let's make new experience in addition to knowledge with this book.

James Rogers:

The book Professional Excel Services (Programmer to Programmer) give you a sense of feeling enjoy for
your spare time. You can use to make your capable considerably more increase. Book can for being your
best friend when you getting strain or having big problem with your subject. If you can make studying a
book Professional Excel Services (Programmer to Programmer) to get your habit, you can get more
advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about some or all subjects. You can know
everything if you like available and read a reserve Professional Excel Services (Programmer to Programmer).
Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science publication or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do
you think about this publication?

Fatima Leonard:

Reading a book to become new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to study a book. When you
study a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge,
simply because book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what types
of book that you have read. If you want to get information about your analysis, you can read education
books, but if you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, as
well as soon. The Professional Excel Services (Programmer to Programmer) offer you a new experience in
reading through a book.

Harley Campbell:

Beside this specific Professional Excel Services (Programmer to Programmer) in your phone, it may give
you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or information. The information and the knowledge you
may got here is fresh through the oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an outdated people live in
narrow village. It is good thing to have Professional Excel Services (Programmer to Programmer) because
this book offers for you readable information. Do you occasionally have book but you seldom get what it's
about. Oh come on, that won't happen if you have this in your hand. The Enjoyable agreement here cannot be
questionable, just like treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss that? Find this book and



read it from at this point!
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