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The Book They Can't Suppress

Not for sixty years has a book been so brutally (and, in the end, unsuccessfully) suppressed as An Eye for an
Eye. One major newspaper, one major magazine, and three major publishers paid $40,000 for it but were
scared off. One printed 6,000 books, then pulped them.

Two dozen publishers read An Eye for an Eye and praised it. "Shocking, "Startling," "Astonishing,"
"Mesmerizing," "Extraordinary," they wrote to Author John Sack. "I was rivited," "I was bowled over," "I
love it," they wrote, but all two dozen rejected it.

Finally, BasicBooks published An Eye for an Eye. It "sparked a furious controversy," said Newsweek. It
became a best-seller in Europe but was so shunned in America that it also became, in the words of New York
Magazine, "The Book They Dare Not Review."

Since then, both 60 Minutes and The New York Times have corroborated what Sack wrote: that at the end of
World War II, thousands of Jews sought revenge for the Holocaust. They set up 1,255 concentration camps
for German civilians -- German men, women, children and babies. There they beat, whipped, tortured and
murdered the Germans.

Long unavailable, An Eye for an Eye is back in a new, revised, updated and illustrated edition. Submitted by
the publisher, John Sack
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From reader reviews:

Corrine Switzer:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information presently can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a expertise or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider any time those information which is inside the former life are difficult to be find than now is taking
seriously which one would work to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you find the
unstable resource then you get it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen inside you if you take An Eye for an Eye: The Untold Story of Jewish Revenge
Against Germans in 1945 as your daily resource information.

Jeff Wheeler:

You can spend your free time you just read this book this e-book. This An Eye for an Eye: The Untold Story
of Jewish Revenge Against Germans in 1945 is simple to develop you can read it in the area, in the beach,
train and also soon. If you did not get much space to bring the printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It
is make you much easier to read it. You can save the actual book in your smart phone. Consequently there
are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Margaret Parker:

You can obtain this An Eye for an Eye: The Untold Story of Jewish Revenge Against Germans in 1945 by
look at the bookstore or Mall. Only viewing or reviewing it could possibly to be your solve problem if you
get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only by written or printed but
additionally can you enjoy this book simply by e-book. In the modern era similar to now, you just looking by
your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your personal ways to get more
information about your e-book. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are
still up-date. Let's try to choose right ways for you.

William Pettigrew:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many concern for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people
likes studying, not only science book and also novel and An Eye for an Eye: The Untold Story of Jewish
Revenge Against Germans in 1945 as well as others sources were given information for you. After you know
how the truly great a book, you feel wish to read more and more. Science book was created for teacher or
even students especially. Those textbooks are helping them to increase their knowledge. In some other case,
beside science book, any other book likes An Eye for an Eye: The Untold Story of Jewish Revenge Against
Germans in 1945 to make your spare time a lot more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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