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On July 6, 1906, Baron Gustaf Mannerheim boarded the midnight train from St. Petersburg, charged by Tsar
Nicholas II to secretly collect intelligence on the Qing Dynasty’s sweeping reforms that were radically
transforming China. One of the last Tsarist secret agents, Mannerheim chronicled almost every facet of
China’s modernization, from education reform and foreign investment to Tibet’s struggle for independence.

On July 6, 2006, writer Eric Enno Tamm boards that same train, intent on following in Mannerheim’s
footsteps. Initially banned from China, Tamm devises a cover and retraces Mannerheim’s route across the
Silk Road, discovering both eerie similarities and seismic differences between the Middle Kingdoms of a
century ago and today.

Along the way, Tamm offers piercing insights into China’s past that raise troubling questions about its
future. Can the Communist Party truly open China to the outside world yet keep Western ideas such as
democracy and freedom at bay, just as Qing officials mistakenly believed? What can reform during the late
Qing Dynasty teach us about the spectacular transformation of China today? As Confucius once wrote,
“Study the past if you would divine the future,” and that is precisely what Tamm does in The Horse That
Leaps Through Clouds.
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From reader reviews:

Theresa Wilkins:

This The Horse That Leaps Through Clouds: A Tale of Espionage, the Silk Road, and the Rise of Modern
China are reliable for you who want to be considered a successful person, why. The main reason of this The
Horse That Leaps Through Clouds: A Tale of Espionage, the Silk Road, and the Rise of Modern China can
be one of many great books you must have will be giving you more than just simple examining food but feed
a person with information that maybe will shock your before knowledge. This book will be handy, you can
bring it everywhere you go and whenever your conditions both in e-book and printed people. Beside that this
The Horse That Leaps Through Clouds: A Tale of Espionage, the Silk Road, and the Rise of Modern China
forcing you to have an enormous of experience like rich vocabulary, giving you demo of critical thinking
that we know it useful in your day task. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Marcy Madison:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
thus. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a book will give you a lot of new info.
When you read a book you will get new information simply because book is one of various ways to share the
information or their idea. Second, reading through a book will make you actually more imaginative. When
you looking at a book especially fiction book the author will bring someone to imagine the story how the
character types do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to other people. When you read
this The Horse That Leaps Through Clouds: A Tale of Espionage, the Silk Road, and the Rise of Modern
China, you may tells your family, friends and also soon about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire the
others, make them reading a reserve.

Ronnie Miller:

You could spend your free time you just read this book this book. This The Horse That Leaps Through
Clouds: A Tale of Espionage, the Silk Road, and the Rise of Modern China is simple to deliver you can read
it in the park, in the beach, train along with soon. If you did not include much space to bring typically the
printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you easier to read it. You can save the actual
book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Blake Darden:

A lot of e-book has printed but it differs. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose the best
book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is known as of book
The Horse That Leaps Through Clouds: A Tale of Espionage, the Silk Road, and the Rise of Modern China.
You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it may add your knowledge and
make anyone happier to read. It is most important that, you must aware about reserve. It can bring you from
one destination to other place.
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