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An acclaimed, groundbreaking, and “powerful exploration” (Washington Post) of the fate of Union veterans,
who won the war but couldn’t bear the peace.

For well over a century, traditional Civil War histories have concluded in 1865, with a bitterly won peace
and Union soldiers returning triumphantly home. In a landmark work that challenges sterilized portraits
accepted for generations, Civil War historian Brian Matthew Jordan creates an entirely new narrative. These
veterans— tending rotting wounds, battling alcoholism, campaigning for paltry pensions— tragically
realized that they stood as unwelcome reminders to a new America eager to heal, forget, and embrace the
freewheeling bounty of the Gilded Age. Mining previously untapped archives, Jordan uncovers anguished
letters and diaries, essays by amputees, and gruesome medical reports, all deeply revealing of the American
psyche.

In the model of twenty-first-century histories like Drew Gilpin Faust’s This Republic of Suffering or Maya
Jasanoff ’s Liberty’s Exiles that illuminate the plight of the common man, Marching Home makes almost
unbearably personal the rage and regret of Union veterans. Their untold stories are critically relevant today.
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From reader reviews:

Joe Vizcarra:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive right now,
people have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place
and notice by means of surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated it for a
while is reading. That's why, by reading a book your ability to survive increase then having chance to endure
than other is high. In your case who want to start reading the book, we give you that Marching Home: Union
Veterans and Their Unending Civil War book as starter and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is
more than just a book.

Toni Bays:

The knowledge that you get from Marching Home: Union Veterans and Their Unending Civil War may be
the more deep you excavating the information that hide into the words the more you get interested in reading
it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to comprehend but Marching Home: Union Veterans and Their
Unending Civil War giving you joy feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in certain way that can
be understood by simply anyone who read this because the author of this guide is well-known enough. This
specific book also makes your vocabulary increase well. It is therefore easy to understand then can go along,
both in printed or e-book style are available. We highly recommend you for having this kind of Marching
Home: Union Veterans and Their Unending Civil War instantly.

George Gomez:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you might have it
in e-book method, more simple and reachable. This Marching Home: Union Veterans and Their Unending
Civil War can give you a lot of buddies because by you taking a look at this one book you have factor that
they don't and make anyone more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of one step for
you to get success. This publication offer you information that maybe your friend doesn't learn, by knowing
more than some other make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? Let me have Marching
Home: Union Veterans and Their Unending Civil War.

Francisco Morgan:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
from the book. Book is prepared or printed or illustrated from each source in which filled update of news.
With this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media
social like newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You can add
your understanding by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just searching
for the Marching Home: Union Veterans and Their Unending Civil War when you necessary it?
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