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Allan Carr was Hollywood’s premier party-thrower during the town’s most hedonistic era—the cocaine-
addled, sexually indulgent 1970s. Hosting outrageous soirees with names like the Mick Jagger/Cycle Sluts
Party and masterminding such lavishly themed opening nights as the Tommy/New York City subway
premiere, it was Carr, an obese, caftan-wearing producer—the ultimate outsider—who first brought movie
stars and rock stars, gays and straights, Old and New Hollywood together.

From the stunning success of Grease and La Cage aux Folles to the spectacular failure of the Village
People’s Can’t Stop the Music, as a producer Carr’s was a rollercoaster of a career punctuated by major hits
and phenomenal flops—none more disastrous than the Academy Awards show he produced featuring a tone-
deaf Rob Lowe serenading Snow White, a fiasco that made Carr an outcast, and is still widely considered to
be the worst Oscars ever.

Tracing Carr’s excess-laden rise and tragic fall—and sparing no one along the way—Party Animals provides
a sizzling, candid, behind-the-scenes look at Hollywood’s most infamous period.
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From reader reviews:

James Gabriel:

Book is definitely written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
reserve. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important matter to bring us around the world.
Beside that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A e-book Party Animals: A Hollywood Tale of
Sex, Drugs, and Rock 'n' Roll Starring the Fabulous Allan Carr will make you to become smarter. You can
feel considerably more confidence if you can know about every thing. But some of you think that open or
reading the book make you bored. It isn't make you fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have you
trying to find best book or suitable book with you?

Michael Counts:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them family
members or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, as
well as playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity that is look different you
can read any book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent all day
every day to reading a guide. The book Party Animals: A Hollywood Tale of Sex, Drugs, and Rock 'n' Roll
Starring the Fabulous Allan Carr it is rather good to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this
book. These were enjoying reading this book. Should you did not have enough space to create this book you
can buy the actual e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book through your smart phone. The price
is not too expensive but this book provides high quality.

Bernice Bland:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book in
comparison with can satisfy your limited time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find
publication that need more time to be study. Party Animals: A Hollywood Tale of Sex, Drugs, and Rock 'n'
Roll Starring the Fabulous Allan Carr can be your answer since it can be read by you who have those short
extra time problems.

Jacqueline Britt:

Within this era which is the greater individual or who has ability to do something more are more valuable
than other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple way to have that. What you should do is
just spending your time very little but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. One of several books in
the top collection in your reading list is actually Party Animals: A Hollywood Tale of Sex, Drugs, and Rock
'n' Roll Starring the Fabulous Allan Carr. This book and that is qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you
closer in turning into precious person. By looking upward and review this publication you can get many
advantages.
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