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It is no accident that the RAF's Battle of Britain Memorial Flight consists primarily of three aircraft types,
the Spitfire, the Hurricane and the Lancaster. The Spitfire and Hurricane, of course, are famous for their roles
during the Battle of Britain over the skies of southern England in 1940. The Lancaster, on the other hand, did
not enter operational service with the RAF until 1942, long after the 'official' Battle of Britain was over. Yet
the aircraft has more than earned its place in the Battle of Britain flight. The Lancaster has carved its place in
history in its own unique way. During the Spitfire's lifetime, more than 20,000 were built while the
Lancaster's total is less than half of that. Yet the Lancaster had a crew of seven, with at least as many again
in each Lanc's ground crew. More personnel, therefore, had a close association with the Lanc than with the
world's most famous fighter plane.Neither should it be forgotten that, when Britain defended its shores as an
island fortress during the darkest days of WW II, the Lancaster and its crews were taking the fight to the
enemy, delivering their deadly payloads to targets deep in the heart of Germany. A tangible reminder to
everyone suffering in Britain that we were still striking back, still fighting, the Lancaster and its crews won
the affection of the British people. Lancasters dropped Barnes Wallis's 'bouncing bombs' on Germany's Ruhr
Valley dams to earn 617 Squadron its 'Dam Busters' nickname and Tony Iveson was among those Lanc
pilots whose aircraft crossed the North Sea to sink the battleship Tirpitz.In Lancaster, Tony Iveson has
created a riveting biography of the aircraft, focussing not just on its operational history, but on the crews who
flew and maintained Lancs, even talking to German fighter pilots who flew against them.The stories in
Lancaster run from the time of its initial design right through the war to when variants such as the
Lancastrian entered civilian service, BOAC using the aircraft on scheduled services between Britain and
Australia from May 1945.A salute to the men and women who built, flew and maintained the Lancaster, this
book stands as a tribute to a truly great British icon.
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From reader reviews:

Luther Roberts:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students because they are still students or that for all people in the
world, exactly what the best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that question above. Every
person has several personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they
don't would like do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Lancaster: The
Biography. All type of book can you see on many options. You can look for the internet resources or other
social media.

Brian Street:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading habit give you lot
of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge even the information inside the book that
improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of publication you read, if
you want have more knowledge just go with training books but if you want truly feel happy read one using
theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. The Lancaster: The Biography is kind of publication
which is giving the reader capricious experience.

Grace Godwin:

The reserve with title Lancaster: The Biography has a lot of information that you can learn it. You can get a
lot of help after read this book. This specific book exist new knowledge the information that exist in this
guide represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to find out how the
improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you inside new era of the internationalization. You
can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Regina Wingler:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book as
compared to can satisfy your limited time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find
reserve that need more time to be examine. Lancaster: The Biography can be your answer as it can be read
by you actually who have those short time problems.
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