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Drawing upon their rich religious and cultural heritage--a heritage that stretches back to Biblical times and
passes through many varied epochs and environments--Jewish sages, artists, writers, and storytellers have
continually created imaginative and evocative formulations of Jewish philosophy, literature, art, law, liturgy,
ritual, and especially new forms of folklore.
Miriam's Tambourine presents fifty classic Jewish folktales that come from virtually every corner of the
globe and every historical period. Readers of all ages will delight in the Jewish versions of the Snow White,
Rapunsel, and Sinbad stories, which in some cases were the original sources of these popular folktales.
Howard Schwartz has also selected and retold those tales which have retained their uniquely Jewish
character and have become part of the heritage of the Jewish people, including the Golem, the tales of Rabbi
Nachman of Bratzlav and of the Ba'al Shem Tov, tales of Elijah the Prophet, Miriam and her mystical well,
Rabbi Adam, and even of the Sambotyon, the legendary river that raged six days of the week and rested on
the Sabbath.
Recast in a form accessible to readers both young and old, yet true to their provenances, these tales continue
to enthrall and capture the imagination as they illustrate the power of man to overcome evil; the longing of
the Jewish people to return to their homeland; and the universal prayer for a world at peace. Providing
careful annotation of sources and a brilliant analysis of meanings and symbolisms, Miriam's Tambourine
represents a landmark in Jewish folk literature and in American-Jewish culture.
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From reader reviews:

Frances Barrett:

Now a day people who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by connect with the internet and the
resources included can be true or not need people to be aware of each facts they get. How many people to be
smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Examining a book
can help folks out of this uncertainty Information especially this Miriam's Tambourine: Jewish Folktales
from Around the World (Oxford paperbacks) book as this book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of
course the details in this book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Dora Bair:

Miriam's Tambourine: Jewish Folktales from Around the World (Oxford paperbacks) can be one of your
basic books that are good idea. We recommend that straight away because this publication has good
vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in language, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still
delivering the information. The copy writer giving his/her effort to set every word into enjoyment
arrangement in writing Miriam's Tambourine: Jewish Folktales from Around the World (Oxford paperbacks)
yet doesn't forget the main point, giving the reader the hottest and also based confirm resource data that
maybe you can be among it. This great information may drawn you into new stage of crucial imagining.

Michelle Garrett:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got learners? We believe that that query was
given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. Therefore you know
that little person just like reading or as looking at become their hobby. You must know that reading is very
important along with book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your
current teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update concerning something by book. Different
categories of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is this Miriam's Tambourine: Jewish
Folktales from Around the World (Oxford paperbacks).

Michael Gage:

Some people said that they feel fed up when they reading a publication. They are directly felt this when they
get a half parts of the book. You can choose the actual book Miriam's Tambourine: Jewish Folktales from
Around the World (Oxford paperbacks) to make your personal reading is interesting. Your current skill of
reading proficiency is developing when you including reading. Try to choose simple book to make you enjoy
to learn it and mingle the feeling about book and studying especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to
wide open a book and examine it. Beside that the guide Miriam's Tambourine: Jewish Folktales from Around
the World (Oxford paperbacks) can to be your brand-new friend when you're experience alone and confuse
with the information must you're doing of these time.
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